
John 1:1 AMPC

1 In the beginning [before all time] was the Word (Christ), and the Word 
was with God, and the Word was God Himself.


Revelation 19:10 AMPC

10 Then I fell prostrate at his feet to worship (to pay divine honors) to 
him, but he [restrained me] and said, Refrain! [You must not do that!] I 
am [only] another servant with you and your brethren who have 
[accepted and hold] the testimony borne by Jesus. Worship God! For 
the substance (essence) of the truth revealed by Jesus is the spirit of all 
prophecy [the vital breath, the inspiration of all inspired preaching and 
interpretation of the divine will and purpose, including both mine and 
yours].


John 17:17 AMPC

17 Sanctify them through thy truth: thy word is truth.


John 17:17 AMPC

17 Sanctify them [purify, consecrate, separate them for Yourself, make 
them holy] by the Truth; Your Word is Truth.


John 14:6 AMPC

6 Jesus said to him, I am the Way and the Truth and the Life; no one 
comes to the Father except by (through) Me.
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Sanctify defined

1. To cleanse, purify or make holy.

2. To separate, set apart or appoint to a holy, sacred or religious use.

3. To purify; to prepare for divine service, and for partaking of holy things

- 1828 Webster’s Dictionary



The Bible is infallible (as stated in 2 Peter 1:19). It is truth, it is life and 
it cleanses our thoughts and separates us from the worlds/cultures way of 
thinking to prepare us for a divine purpose.


2 Peter 1:19-21 AMPC

19 And we have the prophetic word [made] firmer still. You will do well 
to pay close attention to it as to a lamp shining in a dismal (squalid and 
dark) place, until the day breaks through [the gloom] and the Morning 
Star rises ([a]comes into being) in your hearts.

20 [Yet] first [you must] understand this, that no prophecy of Scripture 
is [a matter] of any personal or private or special interpretation 
(loosening, solving).

21 For no prophecy ever originated because some man willed it [to do 
so—it never came by human impulse], but men spoke from God who 
were borne along (moved and impelled) by the Holy Spirit.


God is not the author of confusion and The Truth does matter unless 
Paul would of not spoken about stay away from fairy tales, fables, lies, 
false teaching… why? Because it is divisive and churches split when 
there is multiple options to one Truth. If the pastor is giving an opinion, 
and can not rightly divide the word, says it doesn’t matter, why can’t 
another group or faction in the church divide the Word incorrectly, have 
their opinion?  what does it matter? Everyone is right in their own eyes.


Paul warned Timothy, who is training pastors to watch out for man- 
made fictions, fables, legends in the church…that is an important 
statement regarding God’s Word and applying it to all areas of our life.


Colossians 2:8 AMPC

8 See to it that no one carries you off as spoil or makes you yourselves 
captive by his so-called philosophy and intellectualism and vain deceit 
(idle fancies and plain nonsense), following human tradition (men’s 
ideas of the material rather than the spiritual world), just crude notions 
following the rudimentary and elemental teachings of the universe and 
disregarding [the teachings of] Christ (the Messiah).
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Some of these things may seem trivial, of no importance but building on 
a little error or slight inclination causes the entirety of the outcome to be 
spoiled or ruined.


Galatians 5:9 AMPC

9 A little leaven (a slight inclination to error, or a few false teachers) 
leavens the whole lump [it perverts the whole conception of faith or 
misleads the whole church].


2 Timothy 2:15-16 AMPC

15 Study and be eager and do your utmost to present yourself to God 
approved (tested by trial), a workman who has no cause to be ashamed, 
correctly analyzing and accurately dividing [rightly handling and 
skillfully teaching] the Word of Truth.

16 But avoid all empty (vain, useless, idle) talk, for it will lead people 
into more and more ungodliness.


With scriptures now in the forefront of our minds, we are going to 
address what many in the church and outside of the the church are 
talking about…UFO’s and Aliens. Over the last 3 years, the United 
States has been releasing classified information, photos and videos on 
what they have gathered from the military, from pilots and other 
agencies on Unidentified Flying Objects.


Hebrews 11:3 KJV

3 Through faith we understand that the worlds were framed by the word 
of God, so that things which are seen were not made of things which do 
appear.


Hebrews 11:3 AMPC

3 By faith we understand that the worlds [during the successive ages] 
were framed (fashioned, put in order, and equipped for their intended 
purpose) by the word of God, so that what we see was not made out of 
things which are visible.


By faith, we know that God made the worlds or planets from nothing.
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We, you and I, the scientists and mankind in general can’t see where the 
atoms, the molecules, the smallest organisms that are complex and 
require multiple regulatory mechanisms to coordinate internal functions 
to bring forth life as we know it… but, God made it all from nothing.


Genesis 1:1 KJV

1 In the beginning God created the heaven and the earth.


Let’s focus in on the word “worlds” in Hebrews 11 and in Hebrews 1.


Hebrews 1:2 KJV

2 Hath in these last days spoken unto us by his Son, whom he hath 
appointed heir of all things, by whom also he made the worlds;


Hebrews 11:3 KJV

3 Through faith we understand that the worlds were framed by the word 
of God, so that things which are seen were not made of things which do 
appear.


In the greek, the word “worlds” means in it’s applications: ages, ages 
past, creation, planets, cosmic heavens (relating to the planets). Scripture 
or the “Truth” tells us that the worlds were framed by the Word of God. 
In addition, “worlds framed by the word of God” means: restore, repair, 
mend, complete and to finish. He finished making all of the planets.


We know from our study regarding Heaven that there are levels of 
heaven or the heavens. Paul tells us of the third heaven or paradise.


2 Corinthians 12:2-4 KJV

1 I knew a man in Christ above fourteen years ago, (whether in the body, 
I cannot tell; or whether out of the body, I cannot tell: God knoweth;) 
such an one caught up to the third heaven.

3 And I knew such a man, (whether in the body, or out of the body, I 
cannot tell: God knoweth;)

4 How that he was caught up into paradise, and heard unspeakable 
words, which it is not lawful for a man to utter.
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1 Thessalonians 4:13-18 AMPC

13 Now also we would not have you ignorant, brethren, about those who 
fall asleep [in death], that you may not grieve [for them] as the rest do 
who have no hope [beyond the grave].

14 For since we believe that Jesus died and rose again, even so God will 
also bring with Him through Jesus those who have fallen asleep [in 
death].

15 For this we declare to you by the Lord’s [own] word, that we who are 
alive and remain until the coming of the Lord shall in no way precede 
[into His presence] or have any advantage at all over those who have 
previously fallen asleep [in Him in death].

16 For the Lord Himself will descend from heaven with a loud cry of 
summons, with the shout of an archangel, and with the blast of the 
trumpet of God. And those who have departed this life in Christ will rise 
first.

17 Then we, the living ones who remain [on the earth], shall 
simultaneously be caught up along with [the resurrected dead] in the 
clouds to meet the Lord in the air; and so always (through the eternity of 
the eternities) we shall be with the Lord!

18 Therefore comfort and encourage one another with these words.


We know there are levels of heaven not just from the New Testament 
writers (third heaven) but from Old Testament as well. The Never Wrong 
Prophet Isaiah tell us in Isaiah chapter 14 from our previous studies 
there is 3 heavens: the clouds, the region of the stars and planets and the 
third heaven where God sits and those who have already died righteous.


There are “things” that we have addressed that is being talked about, 
taught, false teaching and or the avoidance of things that is causing 
confusion/division in the church. Satan is trying anything and everything 
to get the follower of Jesus Christ questioning His Word and to cause 
fear and hopelessness by pastors preachiness and teachers not speaking 
the truth. By not rightly dividing the Word, not speaking to the ones 
casing division in the church and by speaking something that God never 
said.
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Paul addressed the New Testament church continuously about false 
teaching…


Romans 16:17-20 AMPC

17 I appeal to you, brethren, to be on your guard concerning those who 
create dissensions and difficulties and cause divisions, in opposition to 
the doctrine (the teaching) which you have been taught. [I warn you to 
turn aside from them, to] avoid them.

18 For such persons do not serve our Lord Christ but their own 
appetites and base desires, and by ingratiating and flattering speech, 
they beguile the hearts of the unsuspecting and simpleminded [people].

19 For while your loyalty and obedience is known to all, so that I rejoice 
over you, I would have you well versed and wise as to what is good and 
innocent and guileless as to what is evil.

20 And the God of peace will soon crush Satan under your feet. The 
grace of our Lord Jesus Christ (the Messiah) be with you.


Titus 3:10-11 AMPC

10 [As for] a man who is factious [a heretical sectarian and cause of 
divisions], after admonishing him a first and second time, reject [him 
from your fellowship and have nothing more to do with him],

11 Well aware that such a person has utterly changed (is perverted and 
corrupted); he goes on sinning [though he] is convicted of guilt and self-
condemned.


Paul said if anyone preaches something different…


Galatians 1:6-10 AMPC

6 I am surprised and astonished that you are so quickly [a]turning 
renegade and deserting Him Who invited and called you [b]by the grace 
(unmerited favor) of Christ (the Messiah) [and that you are transferring 
your allegiance] to a different [even an opposition] gospel.
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7 Not that there is [or could be] any other [genuine Gospel], but there 
are [obviously] some who are troubling and disturbing and 
bewildering

 you [[c]with a different kind of teaching which they offer as a gospel] 
and want to pervert and distort the Gospel of Christ (the Messiah) [into 
something which it absolutely is not].

8 But even if we or an angel from heaven should preach to you a gospel 
contrary to and different from that which we preached to you, let him be 
accursed (anathema, devoted to destruction, doomed to eternal 
punishment)! 9 As we said before, so I now say again: If anyone is 
preaching to you a gospel different from or contrary to that which you 
received [from us], let him be accursed (anathema, devoted to 
destruction, doomed to eternal punishment)!

10 Now am I trying to win the favor of men, or of God? Do I seek to 
please men? If I were still seeking popularity with men, I should not be 
a bond servant of Christ (the Messiah).


From dinosaurs, age of the earth, flat earth and other topics that we have 
addressed in God’s Word, there is one more thing left in this series to 
study…UFO’s and Aliens. Most pastors, preachers and teachers don’t 
want to teach on any of these things….but, whether it is welcome or 
unwelcome, convenient or inconvenient, the truth must be preached.


Did you know that almost 40% (37%) of people in the United States 
believe in UFO’s (unidentified flying objects) and these are alien 
spacecraft from another time dimension or galaxy. While 60% of 
Americans believe there is a natural explanation to what people are 
seeing, a reasonable explanation to the phenomenon of UFO’s.


So, do UFO’s exist? Are there objects that are flying that pilots, military 
personnel and others can not identify… yes. The reporting of UFO’s 
rose exponentially staring in 1948 - interesting, oh wait, that’s when 
Israel became a nation… coincidence?


In the last few years the United States has decided to declassify some 
information on UFO’s and it would be wise to ask why? Why now?
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These reports are not confirming alien life forms on other planets but 
stating there are things, phenomenons taking place and they don’t have 
an answer for them. Phenomenon defined: fact or situation that is 
observed to exist or happen, especially one whose cause or explanation 
is in question.


There has been reports from those involved in secret government 
programs, documentaries, YouTube interviews from those “in the know” 
telling us what they have seen and what they know.


As we conclude this series I want to address what is being seen and what 
explanation can I give you that is Biblical. Also, are there actual alien 
life forms, could they be angelic in nature or demonic… what does the 
Bible say? I am here to give you Bible, to give you the Truth which is 
God’s Word in order to give you peace. 


Let’s start with first addressing the three different dimensions of 
creation. First, the natural world (earth, animals and people), the 
heavenly world (celestial world, sun, moon, stars and cosmos) and then 
the spirit world (the trinity, angels, demons and departed spirits).


The trinity is: God, Jesus and Holy Spirit and angels which is seraphim, 
cherubim, etc. There is demons, principalities and rulers of the air, fallen 
angels and those in the underworld - hades, sheol etc. 


Ephesians 6:12 AMPC

12 For we are not wrestling with flesh and blood [contending only with 
physical opponents], but against the despotisms, against the powers, 
against [the master spirits who are] the world rulers of this present 
darkness, against the spirit forces of wickedness in the heavenly 
(supernatural) sphere.


Job 4:15-16 AMPC

15 Then a spirit passed before my face; the hair of my flesh stood up!

16 [The spirit] stood still, but I could not discern the appearance of it. A 
form was before my eyes;
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The Bible tells us of visitors from outer space or above the clouds, above 
the cosmos and specifically the region of the third heaven.


Satan comes down to the garden where before he was an anointed 
cherubim but was expelled along with one third of the angels. Jesus 
witnessed the event: “I saw Satan fall like lightning from heaven” .


Luke 10:17-18 AMPC

17 The seventy returned with joy, saying, Lord, even the demons are 
subject to us in Your name!

18 And He said to them, I saw Satan falling like a lightning [flash] 
from heaven.


Revelation 12:4 AMPC

4 His tail swept [across the sky] and dragged down a third of the stars 
and flung them to the earth.


Satan has power in the air under the clouds and on this world… notice 
little g on god and not capital G. In Luke 10 it states the the demons are 
subject to His Name.


2 Corinthians 4:4 AMPC

4 For the god of this world has blinded the unbelievers’ minds [that they 
should not discern the truth], preventing them from seeing the 
illuminating light of the Gospel of the glory of Christ (the Messiah), Who 
is the Image and Likeness of God.


Satan was the first visitor from outer space and the second was fallen 
angels referenced above in Revelation 12 but also in Genesis 6. 
Remember, Revelation is the revealing of or the summary of the 
previous 65 books and it is putting all the pieces together for us by way 
of not only remembrance but prophetically making all things known.


John was told to no longer seal up anything but make it all known…
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Genesis 6:4 GNT

4 In those days, and even later, there were giants on the earth who were 
descendants of human women and the heavenly beings.


There were angels that existed before man that came to earth after 
mankind and could manifest themselves in the form of flesh. The angels 
that have appeared on the earth are not all wicked, but righteous as well. 
All throughout scripture as in the story of Lot there were 2 righteous 
angels (Genesis 18) that came in the form of men that communicated 
with Lot get them out of the city before God destroy it.


We know from reading the Bible that here on earth we have had 
visitations from Satan, wicked angles, righteous angels (Michael and 
Gabriel - Daniel 10, Luke 1 etc). There are bound angels under the earth 
and demonic spirits from another dimension in the invisible realm that 
have revealed themselves in the natural.


Jesus also came to earth (another visitor from the third heaven) and 
walked among us and ascended back into heaven where He is sitting at 
the right hand of the Father.


Hebrews 10:12-13 AMPC

12 Whereas this One [Christ], after He had offered a single sacrifice for 
our sins [that shall avail] for all time, sat down at the right hand of God,

13 Then to wait until His enemies should be made a stool beneath His 
feet.


Another visitor is the Holy Spirit…He appeared (Acts 2:2) And 
suddenly there came a sound from heaven as of a rushing mighty wind, 
and it filled all the house where they were sitting.


Acts 2:1-11 AMPC

1 And when the day of Pentecost had fully come, they were all assembled 
together in one place,
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2 When suddenly there came a sound from heaven like the rushing of a 
violent tempest blast, and it filled the whole house in which they were 
sitting.

3 And there appeared to them tongues resembling fire, which were 
separated and distributed and which settled on each one of them.

4 And they were all filled (diffused throughout their souls) with the Holy 
Spirit and began to speak in other (different, foreign) languages 
(tongues), as the Spirit [a]kept giving them clear and loud expression [in 
each tongue in appropriate words].

5 Now there were then residing in Jerusalem Jews, devout and God-
fearing men from every country under heaven.

6 And when this sound was heard, the multitude came together and they 
were astonished and bewildered, because each one heard them [the 
apostles] speaking in his own [particular] dialect.

7 And they were beside themselves with amazement, saying, Are not all 
these who are talking Galileans?

8 Then how is it that we hear, each of us, in our own (particular) dialect 
to which we were born?

9 Parthians and Medes (Iran/easetern Iran) and Elamites (Iran) and 
inhabitants of Mesopotamia (present-day Iraq incl. parts of present-day 
Iran, Kuwait, Syria, Turkey), Judea (Israel) and Cappadocia (Turkey), 
Pontus (Turkey) and [the province of] Asia (Roman Empire - Turkey),

10 Phrygia and Pamphylia (Turkey), Egypt and the parts of Libya about 
Cyrene, and the transient residents from Rome, both Jews and the 
proselytes [to Judaism from other religions],

11 Cretans and Arabians too—we all hear them speaking in our own 
native tongues [and telling of] the mighty works of God!


Acts 1:1-8 AMPC

1 In the former account [which I prepared], O Theophilus, I made [a 
continuous report] dealing with all the things which Jesus began to do 
and to teach

2 Until the day when He ascended, after He through the Holy Spirit had 
instructed and commanded the apostles (special messengers) whom He 
had chosen. 
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3 To them also He showed Himself alive after His passion (His suffering 
in the garden and on the cross) by [a series of] many convincing 
demonstrations [unquestionable evidences and infallible proofs], 
appearing to them during forty days and talking [to them] about the 
things of the kingdom of God.

4 And while being in their company and eating with them, He 
commanded them not to leave Jerusalem but to wait for what the Father 
had promised, Of which [He said] you have heard Me speak.

5 For John baptized with water, but not many days from now you shall 
be baptized with ([a]placed in, introduced into) the Holy Spirit.

6 So when they were assembled, they asked Him, Lord, is this the time 
when You will reestablish the kingdom and restore it to Israel?

7 He said to them, It is not for you to become acquainted with and 
know [b]what time brings [the things and events of time and their 
definite periods] or fixed [c]years and seasons (their critical niche in 
time), which the Father has appointed (fixed and reserved) by His own 
choice and authority and personal power.

8 But you shall receive power (ability, efficiency, and might) when the 
Holy Spirit has come upon you, and you shall be My witnesses in 
Jerusalem and all Judea and Samaria and to the ends (the very bounds) 
of the earth.


The Holy Spirit came from the third heaven down to earth to be with us, 
to be in us, to guide us and remind us of the Truth.


This is the Biblical account of all the created beings, spirits that God has 
created that have visited the earth. We know from the Bible, the Truth, 
the only Truth that we have had the “things” that God has created 
visiting the earth sense the time of Adam or in the beginning, wien the 
earth was created and man on the 6th day.


So, what does this information from the Bible have to do with UFO’s 
and aliens today? We can look back at historical writings and see things 
that have been happening in the heavens for thousands of years. Not just 
sense 1948 where these sightings jumped but before… 
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